
Bid Code Make Model Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine

C1 Chevorlet Malibu 1.5L Turbo Engine N/A N/A 1.5L Turbo Engine N/A N/A 1.5L Turbo Engine N/A N/A
C1A Chevorlet Malibu No Bid 22,989.00$            No Bid
C1B Chevorlet Malibu No Bid NA No Bid
C1D Chevorlet Malibu No Bid NA No Bid
C1C Chevorlet Malibu No Bid  NA No Bid
C2 Chevrolet Trax 1.2L Turbo Engine N/A N/A 1.2L Turbo Engine N/A N/A 1.2L Turbo Engine N/A N/A

C2A Chevrolet Trax $19,437.00 $19,359.00 No Bid
C2B Chevrolet Trax $21,211.00 $21,099.00 No Bid

C2AC Chevrolet Trax $21,398.00 $21,285.00 No Bid
C3 Chevrolet Equinox 1.5L Turbo Engine N/A N/A 1.5L Turbo Engine N/A N/A 1.5L Turbo Engine N/A N/A

C3A Chevrolet Equinox $26,632.00 $26,485.00 No Bid
C3B Chevrolet Equinox $30,698.00 $30,550.00 No Bid
C3C Chevrolet Equinox $28,480.00 $28,333.00 No Bid
C3D Chevrolet Equinox $32,546.00 $32,201.00 No Bid
C4 Chevrolet Traverse 2.5L Turbo Engine N/A N/A 2.5L Turbo Engine N/A N/A 2.5L Turbo Engine N/A N/A

C4A Chevrolet Traverse N/A NA No Bid
C4B Chevrolet Traverse $35,878.00 $35,766.00 No Bid
C4C Chevrolet Traverse N/A NA No Bid
C4D Chevrolet Traverse $37,726.00 $37,614.00 No Bid
C5 Chevrolet Trailblazer 1.2L Turbo Engine .3L Turbo Engin N/A 1.2L Turbo Engine 1.3L Turbo Engine N/A 1.2L Turbo Engine 1.3L Turbo Engine N/A

C5A Chevrolet Trailblazer $21,419.00 $21,814 $21,307.00 $21,654 No Bid No Bid
C5B Chevrolet Trailblazer $22,540.00 $22,935 $22,428.00 $22,775 No Bid No Bid
C5C Chevrolet Trailblazer N/A $23,287 NA $23,175 No Bid No Bid
C5D Chevrolet Trailblazer N/A $24,408 NA $24,296 No Bid No Bid
C6 Chevrolet Blazer 2.0L Turbo engine 3.6L V6 engine N/A 2.0L Turbo engine 3.6L V6 engine N/A 2.0L Turbo engine 3.6L V6 engine N/A

C6A Chevrolet Blazer $31,148.00 N/A $31,582.00 $34,077 No Bid No Bid
C6B Chevrolet Blazer $33,643.00 N/A $35,626.00 $38,120 No Bid No Bid
C7 Chevrolet Tahoe 5.3L V8 3.0 Duramax 6.2L V8 5.3L V8 3.0 Duramax 6.2L V8 5.3L V8 3.0 Duramax 6.2L V8

C7A Chevrolet Tahoe N/A N/A N/A NA NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid
C7B Chevrolet Tahoe $53,856 N/A N/A $53,743 NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid
C7C Chevrolet Tahoe $56,787 $61,787 N/A $56,675 $61,510 NA No Bid No Bid No Bid
C7D Chevrolet Tahoe $54,680 N/A N/A $54,568 NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid
C7E Chevrolet Tahoe $56,604 N/A N/A $56,491 NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid
C7F Chevrolet Tahoe $59,535 $64,649 N/A $59,423 $64,368 NA No Bid No Bid No Bid
C8 Chevrolet Suburban 5.3L V8 3.0 Duramax 6.2L V8 5.3L V8 3.0 Duramax 6.2L V8 5.3L V8 3.0 Duramax 6.2L V8

C8A Chevrolet Suburban N/A N/A N/A NA NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid
C8B Chevrolet Suburban $56,056 N/A N/A $56,018 NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid
C8D Chevrolet Suburban $58,987 $63,987 N/A $58,950 $63,785 NA No Bid No Bid No Bid
C8C Chevrolet Suburban N/A N/A N/A NA NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid
C8D Chevrolet Suburban $58,804 N/A N/A $58,766 NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid
C8E Chevrolet Suburban $61,735 $66,680 N/A $65,812 $66,643 NA. No Bid No Bid No Bid

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for 
additional Manufacturer Models not listed above or 
that may have not been released at the time of this 

bid.
NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF 

CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP

4%

Attachment C
General Motors

Sedans - SUVs- Cross
Gregg Young Husker Auto

0%

Sid Dillon

No Bid

$1,229,347.00 $1,232,287.00Total No Bid

Note: Vehicle highlighted in yellow where used 
tocalculate total.



Bid 
Code Make Model Chassis Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine

C9 Chevrolet Express 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine
C9A Chevrolet Express 2500 Reg $43,166 $41,442 $43,313 $41,645 No BId No BId
C9B Chevrolet Express 2500 Reg $44,666 $42,942 $44,497 $42,829 No BId No BId
C9C Chevrolet Express 3500 Reg $43,503 $41,779 $43,651 $41,983 No BId No BId
C9D Chevrolet Express 3500 Reg $44,999 $43,275 $44,830 $43,162 No BId No BId
C9E Chevrolet Express 3500 Extended $44,626 $42,902 $44,774 $43,106 No BId No BId
C9F Chevrolet Express 3500 Extended $46,452.00 $44,728.00 $45,953.00 $44,285.00 No BId No BId
GM5 GMC Savana 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine

GM5A GMC Savana 2500 Reg No Bid No Bid $43,313 $41,645 No BId No BId
GM5B GMC Savana 2500 Reg No Bid No Bid $44,497 $42,829 No BId No BId
GM5C GMC Savana 3500 Reg No Bid No Bid $43,651 $41,983 No BId No BId
GM5D GMC Savana 3500 Reg No Bid No Bid $44,830 $43,162 No BId No BId
GM5E GMC Savana 3500 Extended No Bid No Bid $44,774 $43,106 No BId No BId
GM5F GMC Savana 3500 Extended No Bid No Bid $45,953.00 $44,285.00 No BId No BId
C10 Chevrolet Express 2500 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine

C10A Chevrolet Express 2500 Reg $38,417 $36,624 $38,399 $36,665 No BId No BId
C10B Chevrolet Express 2500 Extended $40,134 $38,341 $40,117 $38,383 No BId No BId
C10C Chevrolet Express 3500 Reg $41,588 $39,795 $41,570 $39,836 No BId No BId
C10D Chevrolet Express 3500 Extended $42,311 $40,518 $42,293 $40,559 No BId No BId
GM6 GMC Savana 2500 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine

GM6A GMC Savana 2500 Reg No Bid No Bid $38,399 $36,665 No BId No BId
GM6B GMC Savana 2500 Extended No Bid No Bid $40,117 $38,383 No BId No BId
GM6C GMC Savana 3500 Reg No Bid No Bid $41,570 $39,836 No BId No BId
GM6D GMC Savana 3500 Extended No Bid No Bid $42,293 $40,559 No BId No BId

Note: Vehicle highlighted in yellow where used to calculate total.
No BId$841,850.00$842,208.00Total

Husker Auto

0%

Sid Dillon

No BId

Attachment D
General Motors 

Vans

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for
additional Manufacturer Models not listed above 
or that may have not been released at the time of 

this bid.
NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF

4%

Gregg Young



Bid Code Make Model Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine

C11 Chevrolet Colorado 2.7L Turbo 2.7L Turbo Plus 2.7L TurboMax N/A 2.7L Turbo 2.7L Turbo Plus 2.7L TurboMax N/A 2.7L Turbo 2.7L Turbo Plus 2.7L TurboMax N/A
C11A Chevrolet Colorado No Bid No Bid No Bid NA NA NA NA NA NA
C11B Chevrolet Colorado No Bid No Bid No Bid NA NA NA NA NA NA
C11C Chevrolet Colorado No Bid No Bid No Bid NA NA NA NA NA NA
C11D Chevrolet Colorado No Bid No Bid No Bid NA NA NA NA NA NA
C12 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel

C12A1 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 $33,418.00 N/A N/A N/A $33,329.00 NA NA NA $33,173.00 NA NA NA
C12A2 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 N/A N/A N/A N/A NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA
C12B1 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 $37,100.00 N/A N/A N/A $37,012.00 NA NA NA $36,854.00 NA NA NA
C12B2 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 N/A N/A N/A N/A NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA

C12 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel
C12C1 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 $33,604.00 $36,284.00 N/A N/A $33,516.00 $36,107.00 NA NA $33,358.00 $35,949.00 $ NA
C12C2 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 N/A N/A N/A N/A NA NA NA NA NA NA $ NA
C12D1 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 $37,286.00 $39,966.00 N/A N/A $37,198.00 $39,790.00 NA NA $37,043.00 $39,635.00 $ NA
C12D2 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 N/A N/A N/A N/A NA NA NA NA NA NA $ NA

C12 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel
C12E Chevorlet Silverado 1500 $34,690.00 $37,370.00 N/A $45,819 $34,602.00 $37,193.00 NA $43,889 $34,453.00 $37,044.00 NA N/A
C12F Chevorlet Silverado 1500 $37,162.00 $39,842.00 N/A $46,123 $37,074.00 $39,666.00 NA $45,719 $37,113.00 $39,835.00 NA N/A
C12 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel

C12G Chevorlet Silverado 1500 $36,824.00 $39,864.00 N/A $46,400 $36,736.00 $39,675.00 NA $45,976 $36,683.00 $39,622.00 NA N/A
C12H Chevorlet Silverado 1500 $39,297.00 $41,977.00 $52,563.00 $48,210 $39,208.00 $41,800.00 NA $47,805 $39,153.00 $41,744.00 NA N/A
C12 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel
C12I Chevorlet Silverado 1500 $37,104.00 $39,784.00 N/A $46,673 $37,015.00 $39,607.00 NA $46,249 $36,963.00 $39,554.00 NA N/A
C12J Chevorlet Silverado 1500 $39,576.00 $42,256.00 $52,837.00 $49,079 $39,488.00 $42,079.00 NA $48,655 $39,430.00 $42,030.00 NA N/A

Note: Vehicle highlighted in yellow where used tocalculate total.

Husker Auto

3%

Sid Dillon
Attachment E

General Motors
Light Duty Trucks

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount 
for additional Manufacturer Models not listed 
above or that may have not been released at 

the time of this bid.
NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE 

4%

Gregg Young

Total $683,404.00 $679,636.00$681,095.00

0%



Bid 
Code Make Model Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine

C13 Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8
C13A Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 $40,911.00 $51,226 No Bid No Bid $40,673.00 $49,024
C13B Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 $42,876 $53,191 No Bid No Bid $42,630 $50,981
C13 Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8

C13C Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 $41,368.00 $50,004 No Bid No Bid $41,223.00 $49,574
C13D Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 $43,333 $51,969 No Bid No Bid $43,187 $51,538
C13 Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8

C13E Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 $41,551.00 $50,187 No Bid No Bid $41,413.00 $49,764.00
C13F Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 $43,516 $52,152 No Bid No Bid $43,371.00 $51,722.00
C13 Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8

C13G Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 $43,217.00 $51,853 No Bid No Bid $43,083.00 $51,434.00
C13H Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 $45,182 $53,818 No Bid No Bid $45,043.00 $53,394.00
C13 Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8
C13I Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 $43,300.00 $51,936 No Bid No Bid $43,255.00 $51,606.00
C13J Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 $45,365 $54,001 No Bid No Bid $45,223.00 $53,574.00
C14 Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8

C14A Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 $42,010.00 $52,325 No Bid No Bid $41,773.00 $51,740.00
C14B Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 $43,975.00 $54,290 No Bid No Bid $43,730.00 $53,704.00
C14 Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8

C14C Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 $42,650.00 $51,286 No Bid No Bid $42,505.00 $50,856.00
C14D Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 $44,615 $53,251 No Bid No Bid $44,733.00 $52,824.00
C14 Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8

C14E Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 $44,316.00 $52,952 No Bid No Bid $44,173.00 $52,524.00
C14F Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 $46,281.00 $54,917.00 No Bid No Bid $46,053.00 $54,396.00
C14G Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 $44,499.00 $53,135.00 No Bid No Bid $44,363.00 $52,705.00
C14H Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 $46,464.00 $55,100.00 No Bid No Bid $46,320.00 $54,673.00

Husker Auto

Sid Dillon

Attachment F
General Motors

Heavy Duty Trucks
Gregg Young

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount 
for additional Manufacturer Models not listed 
above or that may have not been released at 

the time of this bid.
NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE 
OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP

4%

Total $1,733,022.00 No Bid $1,718,784.00

No bid 3%



Bid 
Code Make Model Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine

C19 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Special Service 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 engine 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 engine 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 engine
C19A Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Special Service N/A No Bid No Bid
C19B Chevrolet Silverado 1500 Special Service $43,340 No Bid 43,613.00$    
C20 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 Police Pursuit 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 engine 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 engine 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 engine

C20A Chevrolet Silverado 1500 Police Pursuit $46,420.00 No Bid 46,592.00$    
C21 Chevrolet Tahoe Special Service 5.3L V8 engine 5.3L V8 engine 5.3L V8 engine

C21A Chevrolet Tahoe Special Service $50,090.00 No Bid 50,463.00$    
C22 Chevrolet Tahoe Police Pursuit 5.3L V8 engine 5.3L V8 engine 5.3L V8 engine

C22A Chevrolet Tahoe Police Pursuit $47,422.00 No Bid 47,523.00$    
C22B Chevrolet Tahoe Police Pursuit $49,998.00 No Bid 50,273.00$    
C23 Chevrolet Express Transport Van 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L gas V8 engine 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L gas V8 engine 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L gas V8 engine

C23A Chevrolet Express Transport Van 2500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 36,230.00$    37,963.00$    No Bid
C23B Chevrolet Express Transport Van 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 39,370.00$    41,103.00$    No Bid
C23C Chevrolet Express Transport Van 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 40,033.00$    41,766.00$    No Bid

C24 Chevrolet Blazer EV Police Pursuit 20-amp relay 30-amp/ 40-amp relay 50-amp /100-amp 20-amp relay 30-amp/ 40-amp relay 50-amp /100-amp 20-amp relay 30-amp/ 40-amp relay 50-amp /100-amp
C24A Chevrolet Blazer EV Police Pursuit Vehicle $53,145.00 Inc Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid 52,390.00$    No Bid No Bid

Attachment G
General Motors

Emergency Services

Electric Vehicle 

Note: Vehicle highlighted in yellow where used tocalculate total.

Sid Dillon Chevrolet

Electric Vehicle 

3%

Total $290,415.00 NO BId $290,854.00

Electric Vehicle 

Gregg Young Husker Auto

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for additional 
Manufacturer Models not listed above or that may have not been 

released at the time of this bid.
NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF CURRENT 

MANUFACTURER MSRP

3% No BId
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